
CONTACT:

DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCTS OR 
SERVICES DESIRED

QTY MODEL PRICE QUOTE PRICE QUOTE PRICE QUOTE PRICE QUOTE PRICE QUOTE

1. 4R70W w/converter FORD $1,400.00 $1,405.00 $1,500.00
2 A4LD w/converter FORD $1,100.00 $1,405.00 $1,310.00
3. A4LD-HD w/converter  FORD $1,200.00 $1,405.00 $1,310.00
4. E40D w/converter FORD $1,450.00 $1,695.00 $1,800.00
5. AOD Overdrive w/converter 2x2 FORD $950.00 $990.00 $1,100.00
6. Crown Victoria AODE w/converter FORD $1,300.00 $1,305.00 $1,350.00
7. Crown Victoria AOD-E w/converter FORD $1,300.00 $1,305.00 $1,350.00
8 AOT/AOD w/converter 4x4 FORD $1,300.00 $990.00 $1,150.00
9. C-6 w/converter 2x2 FORD $800.00 $795.00 $800.00
10. C-6 w/converter 4x4 FORD $1,000.00 $895.00 $850.00
11. 700 R4 0D w/converter GM $900.00 $990.00 $1,150.00
12. 700 R4 OD w/converter 4X4 GM $1,000.00 $990.00 $1,185.00
13. 4L80 E w/converter GM $1,600.00 $1,695.00 $1,800.00
14. 4T60 E w/converter GM $1,300.00 $1,505.00 $1,600.00
15. 540 w/converter ALLISON $2,000.00 N-B NO BID
16. 542 w/converter ALLISON $2,000.00 N-B NO BID
17. 545 w/converter ALLISON $2,000.00 N-B NO BID
18. 640 w/converter ALLISON $2,000.00 N-B NO BID
19. 643 w/converter ALLISON $2,000.00 N-B NO BID
20. 654 w/converter ALLISON $2,000.00 N-B NO BID

NO. OF NOTIFICATIONS MAILED 54
NO. OF BIDS DOWNLOADED   ASSISTANT PURCHASING AGENT: DONALD RILEY
NO. OF BIDS RECEIVED: 3  DATE COMPLETED:    5/17/06
NO. OF MBES NOTIFICATIONS MAILED: DATE:
NO OF MBES RECEIVED:

4. VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODEVENDOR CODE
PRECISION TRANSMISSION

VENDOR CODE

2. VENDOR NAME
ATLAS TRANSMISSION, INC.

 

ADDRESS:

MABLETON, GA 30126

1571 DONALD LEE HOLLOWELL PKWY 6900 MABELTON PKWY

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES     

ADDRESS:

AAMCO TRANSMISSIONI
VENDOR CODE

3. VENDOR NAME

ADDRESS:

1.VENDOR NAME

BID TABULATION SHEET
PAGE 1 OF 1 OPEN DATE: 05/11/06

PC #: 

BID NUMBER:   06ITB50001YA-DR
BID DESCRIPTION: TRANSMISSION REPAIRREBUILD SERVICES

DATE RECIEVED:

NON RESPONSIVE 
VENDORS AND OTHER 

INFORMATION

5. VENDOR NAME

VENDOR CODE

NO-BIDS: CHIEF ASSISTANT:
DEPT. AUTHORIZATION:

   
NO RESPONSE:

 

ADDRESS: ADDRESS:

CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE:

EAST POINT, GA 303044

CONTACT: James Latimore CONTACT:  Sachin Gupta

TELEPHONE: 404-766-7555
FAX: 404-766-7149

TELEPHONE: 404-794-9503
FAX:

TELEPHONE: 770-948-1902
FAX:  770-948-1929

2690 N. CHURCH STREET

CONTACT:  Ralph Brand CONTACT: 

TELEPHONE:


