W BID TAB
06ITEVEHICLES 07K-NH | OFENINO DATE 1272007
B DESCR iOMNs MOTOR VEHICLES MODEL YEAR 2006
UESTI [] MENTI GENERAL SERVICES
| ] = VENBOR NAME YENDOR NAME VENBOR NAME VENBOR NAME : E
] = E Allna Vigh Tl Mnok Antomotive Bill Heard Chevrolet Lugmay Ford ax
u2 ABBRESS APPRETS APRRESS ADRRESS 2 E
E 5 6790 Mt. Zion Bhed.,, Morrow, GA | 1240 Auto Park Drive Kennesaw, GA | 4310 Joneshoro Road Union City, | 413 Industrial Blwd Mc Donough, G A 302453 = =
sz 3014 GA 30201 E E
s TELEPHONE: TELEFHONE TELEPHONE TELEPHONE a3
g E 770-968-0680 770-120-2487 770-964-1311 770-914-2800 E E
=] s _:‘: CONTACT: CONTAET: CONTAET: CONTAET: 2F
Bob Burtner Phil Cole Dewey Easley Il Jeff Hall = E
BIDDERS
6.1 AUTOMOBILES AND STATION RESPONSH TOTAL HIDDEYS RESPONSE TOTAL BIDDER'S RESPONSE TOTAL HIDDEYS RESFONSE TOTAL NO D
WAGONS - 2007 MODELS
COMNPACT CERTIFIED LEV LATE MIDS
o |4-Door Sedan, 4 CYL.
MName and Model Nurmber Ford Focus P34 Pontiac Vibe 251 26 [aven 1TD6E Ford Focus P34
Engine Size CIDILIT HF 2.0 136 1.8 126 1.5 103 121020 136
Add far Driver Air Bag Inciu $745.00 St Inciu
Add for Anti-Lock Braked $350.00 Wlieg Std $450.00
Add for Full Size Spare Tire i, A s, A,
Add for HD Alternator I W Stof A
Add for Cruise $ Ihijs, $125.00 $375.00 $450
Delivery (Calendar Days ARC) J6n-a0 Ja0-150 B0-90 B0-90
Lnit Price F.O B Destination $12,750.00 $15,189.00 $10,950.00, $11,376.00
COMFACT CNG
s [4-Deor Sedan, 4 CYL.
MNarme and Model Nurmber INo Bid o Bid o Bid 1o Bid
Engine Size CID/LIT HF o Bid Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bidl
dd for Driver Air Bag o Bi o Bid Mo Bid No Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes I Bid o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Full Size Spare Tire o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for HD Alternator INo Bid o Bid o Bid 1o Bid
Add for Cruise § o Bid o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARQ) o Bid o Bid Mo Bid 1o Bid
Unit Price F.O.B Destinatian Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
COMPACT HYBRID**
ws |d-Door Sedan, 4 CYL.
MName and Model Nurmber I Eid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Engine Size CID/LIT HF o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
dd for Driver Air Bag o Bid o Bid Mo Bid No Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes I Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Full Size Spare Tire o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for HD Alternator I Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid
Addfar Cruise § o Bid o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delvery (Calendar Days ARC) I Bid o Rid o Bid INo Hid
Unit Price F.O.B Destination Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MID-SIZE {5 or § PASSENGER),
CERTIFIED LEV
wo [-Deor Sedan, § CYL 3.4 L MIN,,
MName and Model Nurmber [Ford Fusion P07 Fontiac G6 272G 69 Chevrolet Malibu Ford Five Hundred P24
Engine Size CIDFILIT HP 5.0 160 2.4 169 3.5 217 182/3.0 203
Add for Driver Air Bag Inciu $210.00 Std Jinciu.
oo for Ant-LoCK Brakes F520. 00| $400.00 Sid Inci.
Add for Full Size Spare Tire b s A s, VA
Add for HD Alternatar Ihsa (A Std A
Add for Cruise § linciu Std Jinciu
Delivery (Calendar Dawvs ARCQ) lbi0- 0 B0-90 50-90
Unit Price F.O.B Destination '_ $18,780.00 $14,834.00 $14599.00 $18,254.00
|




BIE NUMBER: BSSITBVEHICLESS7TK-NH Allan Vigil Ford ol Maok Bill Heard Chevrolet Lagasy Fard PAOE #2

LARGE CERTIFIED LEV RESPONSE TOTAL RESFONSE TSTAL RESPONSE TOTAL RESFONSE TOTAL
MID-SIZE (5 or § PASSENGER),
HYBRID***##+
x [4-Deor Sedan, & CYL 3.0 L MIN,,
MName and Model Nurmber Iho Bid Mo Bid o Bidt o Bid
Engine Size CIDILIT HF Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Bid
Add far Driver Alr Bag o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes o Bid o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Full Size Spare Tire o Bid Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid
Add for HD Alternator [N Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Cruise $ Iho Bid Mo Bidd Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARQ) o Bid Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid
Unit Price F.O.B Destination Ho Bid INo Bid No Bid INo Bid
LARGE
CERTIFIED LEV
r [4-Deor Sadan, & CYL 4.6 L MIN,,
MName and Mode| Nurmber [Crovn Victoria P73 Mo Bid Chevrolet Impala 1¥WB18 Fard Crown Victaria P73
Engine Size CIOIT HF g 220 Mo Bid 3.5L 211 261746 224
Add for Driver Air Bag inciu Mo Bid Std Jinciu.
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes fInclu Mo Bid Std Inclu.
A for Full Size Spare Tire $100.00 Mo Bid s, $115.00f
Add for HO Alternatar Ihsa, Mo Bid Std A
Add for Cruise $ linclu. Mo Bid std Jinciu
Delivery (Calendar Days ARQ) lE0-00 Mo Bid 60-90 60-90
Unit Frice F.O B Destination $19,587.00 No Bid $15,390.00 $19,502.00
MID-SIZE

(¢ PASSENGER) CERTIFIED LEV

4-Deor STATION WAGON, 8 CYL (3.8 L MIN.)

MName and Model Nurmber [Ford Freestyle K02 Mo Bid o Bidt Ford Freestyle KO 2
Engine Size CID/LIT HF 5.0 203 Mo Bid o Bid 1682/3.0 203
dd for Driver Alr Bag linclu Mo Bid Mo Bid Inclu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes lInclu. Mo Bid o Bid Inclu.
Add for Full Size Spare Tire Ihass Mo Bid o Bid VA
Add for HD Alternatar I Mo Bid o Bid A
Add for Cruise $ lInclu. Mo Bid o Bidt Inclu.
Delivery (Calendar Dawvs ARC) lbi0- 0 Mo Bid o Bid E-QD
Unit Price F.O B Destination '_ $21,55.00 [No Bid Mo Bid [ $21,300.00
SMALL CERTIFIED LEV
2WD, SWH, 1284 PAYLOAD, & CYL
MName and Model Nurnber Ranger R10 Mo Bid Colorado ©510503 Ranger R10
Engine Size CIDLIT He 2.3 143 Mo Bid 3.7 242 182/3.0 148
Add for Driver Air Bag Inclu Mo Bid Std Inclu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes [ Mo Bid Std Inciu
Add for HD Alternator i Mo Bid Stol A
Add for Extended CAB $1,832.00| Mo Bid $2,893.00| $2,239.00
Add for Cruise $337.00 Mo Bid Std 385.00]
Delivery (Calendar Days ARC) 60-90 o Bid 50-90 60-90
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination $10,880.00| No Bid $11,799.00 $  10,884.00
SMALL CERTIFIED LEV
SWE, LWE, 1488 PAYLOAD, § CYL
IName and Model Nurmber Ranger 11 Mo Bid Mo Bid Ranger R11
Engine Size CIDILIT Hr 3.0 148 Mo Bid Mo Bid 182130 148
Add for Driver Air Bag Inchy. Mo Bid o Bid Inclu.
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inchu. N Bid o Bid Inclu.
Add for HD Alternator i Mo Bid Mo Bid A
Add for Extended CAE $1,832.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid 1,145.00
Add for Cruise §337.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid 385.00
Delivery (Calendar Days ARC) 60-90 Mo Bid Mo Bid £0-90

Unit Frice F.O.B. Destination $14,007.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid 14,920.00|




BID NUMBER: OSITHVEHICLESS7H-NH Allan Vigil Ford Cual Bluok Antemetive Bill Heard Chevrolet Lagasy Ford FAGE #3
DESCRIPTION REIFONSE TOTAL RESFONIE TOTRL RESFONSE TOTAL RESFONSE TOTAL
SMALL ELECTRIC VEHICLE
w_|ZWD, SWB, T88 PAYLOAD, 30 HP
Engine Size CID/LT Hp o Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Bid
Addd for Driver Air Bag Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes o Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Bid
Add for HD Alternator o Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Bid
Add for Extended CAB Mo Bid N Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Cruise o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARC) o Bid o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid
STANDARD. FULL 8I1ZE CERTIFIED LEV
»a [2WD, SWB, 1204 PAYLOAD, § GYL
MName and Model Nurmber F150 F12 GMC TC 10703 CC10703 Ford F150 F12
Engine Size CIDiLIT Hp a2 202 43148 195/285HP 4.3 195 256042 202
Add far Driver Air Bag Inciu e Std Inciu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inclu MIC Std Incly
Add for HD Alternator Mis A Std A
Add for Extended CAB §4,853.00 $4,814.00 $3,205.00 5,110.00
Add for Cruise §187.00 $240.00 $210.00 225.00
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) 60-90 90-120 50-90 £0-90
Lnit Price F.OB. Destination $12,986.00 §13,853.00 §14,500.00| 12,330.00
STRNDARD. FULL SIZE CERTIFIED LEY
= |TWS, S'WE, 2000 PAYLOAD, 8 CYL, Min. &4 L
MName and Model Nurmber F150 Fiz GMC TC10803 CC10903 Ford F150 F12
Engine Size CIDILIT Hp 54 300 53 315 4.8 295 330/5.4 300
Add for Driver Air Bag lInclu. NG St Inclu.
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inclu NG Stol Inclu.
Add for HD Alternator i MiA Stol A
Add for Bxtended CAB §$3,409.00 $4,814.00 $3,295.00 5,110.00
Add for Cruise §197.00 $240.00 $210.00 225.00)
Delivery (Calendar Days ARQ) 50-50 E0-90 50-90 60-90
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination $15,459.00 $14,496.00| $15,498.00 14,744.00|
STANDARD, FULL SIZE CNG
w |2WD, LWB, 2450 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl.
Min 54 L wildship Underbody Tank
MName and Model Nurmber o Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Bid
Engine Size CIDILIT He Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Driver Air Bag o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes 1o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for HD Alternator o Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Bid
Add for Extended CAB 1o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bidd
Add for Cruise Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) o Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Bid
Unit Price F.OB. Destination INo Bid INo Bid No Bid INo Bid
STANDARD, FULL SIZE
CERTIFIED LEV
sa |2WD, LWE, 2680 Lb. Payload, $ Cyi.
Min R4 L
MName and Model Nurmber F150 F12 GMC TC 20903 £C20803 Ford F150 F12
Engine Size CIDILIT Hp 5.4 300 8.0 363 5.0 353 330054 200
Add for Driver Air Bag Inchu NG St Inclu.
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inciu (s Stol Incl.
Add for HD Alternator it MNIA Std A
Add for Extended CAB $3,409.00| $3,827.00| $3,497 00| 5110.00
[Add for Cruise $197.00 $240.00 $210.00 225.00)
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) 60-90 50-90 50-90 60-90
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination $16,410.00 $189.00 $18526.00 15,704.00|




BID NUMBER: 061 TBVEHICLESO7K-NH Allan Vigil Ford Carl Black Automotive Bill Heard Chevrolet Legacy Ford PAGE
#4
DESCRIPTION
RESPONSE TOTAL RESPONSE TOTAL RESPONSE TOTAL RESPONSE TOTAL
STANDARD, FULL SIZE
CERTIFIED LEV
2WD, LWB, 4100 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl,
on
Min. 5.4 L
Name and Model Number
F250 F20 GMC TC 20903 ©C20903 No Bid
Engine Size CID/LIT Hp
5.4 6.0 353 6.0 353 No Bid
Add for Driver Air Bag
INC NC Std No Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes
INC NC std No Bid
Add for HD Alternator
N/A N/A Std No Bid
Add for Extended CAB
$2,330.00 $3,827.00 $3,497.00 No Bid
Add for Cruise
$337.00 $240.00 $210.00 No Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)
60-90 60-90 60-90 No Bid
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination
$16,250.00 $189.00 $18,828.00 No Bid
STANDARD CERTIFIED LEV
4WD, LWB, 1400 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl
o
Name and Model Number
F150 F14 GMC TK 10903 CK10703 Ford F150 F14
Engine Size CID/LIT Hp
46 248 48 295 48 295 281/4.6 248
Add for Driver Air Bag
Inclu. NIC std Inclu.
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes
Inclu. NIC Std Inclu.
Add for HD Alternator
N/A N/A Std N/A
Add for Extended CAB
$6,076.00 $4,814.00 $3,660.00 5,110.00
Add for Cruise
$197.00 $240.00 $210.00 225.00
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)
60-90 90-120 60-90 60-90




Unit Price F.O.B. Destination
$17,048.00 $16,998.00 $18,099.00 15,787.00
STANDARD, FULL SIZE
CERTIFIED LEV
4WD, LWB, 1600 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl
o
Min5.4 L
Name and Model Number
F150 F14 GMC TK 10903 CK10903 Ford F150 F14
Engine Size CID/LIT Hp
5.4 300 53L 315 48 295 330/5.4 300
Add for Driver Air Bag
Inclu. NIC Std Inclu.
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes
Inclu. N/C std Inclu.
Add for HD Alternator
N/A N/A Std N/A
Add for Extended CAB
$3,409.00 $4,814.00 $3,660.00 4,100.00
Add for Cruise
$197.00 $240.00 $210.00 225.00
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)
60-90 60-90 60-90 60-90
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination $17,664.00 $17,470.00 $18,345.00 16,808.00
STANDARD, FULL SIZE
CERTIFIED LEV
4WD, LWB, 2600 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl.
o
Min. 5.4.L
Name and Model Number
F150 F14 GMC TK 20903 CK20903 Ford F150 F14
Engine Size CID/LIT Hp
5.4 300 6.0 353 6.0 353 3305.4 300
Add for Driver Air Bag
Inclu. N/C Std Incl
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes
Inclu. NIC std Inclu
Add for HD Alternator
N/A N/A std N/A
Add for Extended CAB
$3,409.00 $3,827.00 $3,497.00 4,100.00




Add for Cruise
$197.00 $240.00 $210.00 225.00

Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)

60-90 60-90 60-90 60-90
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination $18,700.00 $21,870.00 $21,599.00 17,594.00
STANDARD, FULL SIZE

PROPANE
4WD, LWB, 2600 Lb. Payload, 8 Cyl,
ol
Min5.4 L
Name and Model Number
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engine Size CID/LIT Hp
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Add for Driver Air Bag

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Add for HD Alternator No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Add for Extended CAB

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Add for Cruise

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unit Price F.O.B. Destination

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




|
BID TAB

BIP NUMFER:  9GITBVYEHICLES#TH-NH

Allan Vigil Ford

Bill Heard Chevrolet

Lagmay Ford

DESCRIFTION

TOTRL

TOTAL

STANDARD, FULL 31ZE

CERTIFIED LEY

= |4, LWE, 3300 Lb. Payload, § Cyi

Min %4 L

MName and Model Nurmber

F 250

F21

GMC TK 30903

CK30803

Ford F350 F31

Engine Size CID/LIT Hr

300

6.0 3453

6.0 353

330045 4 300

Add for Driver Air Bag

Inchu.

i3

Std

Incld.

Add for Anti-Lock Brakes

Inchi

i3

Std

Incly

Add for HD Alternator

iR

A

Std

A

Add for Extended CAB

52,330.00

$3,778.00

3,497 00

2,866.00

Add for Cruise

$337.00

$240.00

$210.00

235.00|

Delivery (Calendar Days ARC)

50-30

60-90

50-30

50-90

Unit Price F.O.B. Destination

$19,258.00

$22,987.00)

$23,380.00

19,588.00

43 [PICK UP TRUCKS AND FULL-SIZE

CAB AND CHASSIS TRUCKS

2007 NODELS

= |STANDARD, FULL $IZE CERTIFIED LEV

Crews Cab 2WD, LWE, 4524 L.

Puylond, & CyL, 6.8 L Dlscal Singla

MName and Model Nurmber

F 350 WW3n

Mo Bid

CC30943

Ford F350 W30

Engine Size CIO/LIT Hr

5.4

340

Mo Bid

6.6 365

6.4 340

Add for Driver Air Bag

Inciu

Mo Bid

Std

Inciu

Add for Anti-Lock Brakes

Inclu.

Mo Bid

Std

Incl.

Add for Full Size Spare Tire

Inch.

Mo Bid

$100.00

Inci.

Add for HD Alternator

$75.00

Mo Bid

Std

175.00]

Add for Cruise

$350.00

Mo Bid

$230.00

385.00]

Dielivery (Calendar Days ARQ)

60-90

Mo Bid

60-50

60-90

Lnit Price, F.OB. Destination

$26,866.00

No Bid

$30,399.00

26,435.00

STANDARD, FULL 3IZE

CERTIFIER LEV

= |Crew Cuk TWD, LWE, 3384 Lb. Paylondl

8 Cyl, 6.03 L Desel Dual Rear Whesl

MName and Model Nurmber

F 350

W32

GMG TC 30943

CC30943

Ford F350 W32

Engine Size CIOLIT Hr

350

b AL 365

6.6 365

6.4 340

Add for Driver Air Bag

Inciu

NIC:

Std

Inciu

Add faor Anti-Lock Brakes

Inclu

NIC

Std

Inciu

Add for Full Size Spare Tire

Inch.

MG

$100.00

Incl.

Add for HD Alternator

$75.00

125 A Std

St

175.00]

Add for Cruise

§350.00

$240.00

$230.00

385.00]

Delivery (Calendar Days ARC)

50-50

60-90

50-30

50-90

nit Price, F.OB. Destination

$27,354.00|

$31,155.00

$30,600.00

26,996.00

SPECIALTY CAB AND CHASSIS

CERTIFIED LEV

0 |2ND, 4T Vikesllass Cab and Chasals

wriGe™ CA, Dmal Rear Wilkaals, BOIS Lb

Payiead and 15,000 GVVL, § O3l 7.3

MNarme and Mode! Nurmber

F 450

Fi46

GMC TC 4C042

4500

Ford F450  F46

Engine Size CIDALIT Hr

6.4

6.6L 300

6.fi 300

6.4 340

Add for Driver Air Bag

Inciu

$184.00

$176.00

Inciu

Add for Anti-Lock Brakes

Inch.

§184.00

Std

Incl.

Add for Full Size Spare Tire

§298.00

$3654.00

$125.00

Incl.

Add for HD Alternator

$75.00

1604 std §342.00]

Std

175.00]

Add for Cruise

$350.00

§120.00

$230.00

385.00|

Delivery (Calendar Days ARC)

50-120

120

50-120

120-150

nit Price, F.OB. Destination

$26,919.00

$32, 196.00|

$32,219.00

27,120.00|




B NUMBER: TTEVEHICLES#7K-NH Allan Vigil Ford Cual BMuok Autemetive Bill Heard Chevrolet Lagasy Ferd PRAGE #8
DESCRIPTION RESFONSE TOTAL RESFONIE TOTAL RESPONSE TOTAL RESFONSE TOTAL
SPECIALTY CAB AND CHASSIS
CERTIFIED LEV
0d | W, T Wil Cab sand Chassls
ol 68" CA, Dmal Eaar Wikoals, 114,428 Lb.
Payload amd 17,800 GV, B O3,
7.3 L Masel Minkmam
MName and Model Nurmber F 550 F 56 GMC TCAC042 C4500 Ford F550  F56
Engine Size CIDILIT Hr 5.4 350 6 BL 300 5.6 300 6.4 350
Add for Driver Air Bag Inciu $184.00 $175.00 Inciu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inclu. §184.00 Std Inciy.
Add for Full Size Spare Tire $288.00 $364.00 §125.00 Inciu.
Add for HO Alternator $75.00 1504 5td $342.00 St 175.00
Add for Cruise $350.00 $120.00 $230.00 385.00)
Delivery (Calendar Days ARC) 90-120 120 90-120 120-150
Unit Price, F.OB. Destination $29,126.00| $33,006.00| $32,599.00 28,529.00|
4.4 |VANS, PASSENGER
2007 NODELS
MINI-VANS CERTIFIED LEV
1 |7 Fassanger, § Cyl., Min .8 L
Marne and Model Nurmber Mo Bid o Bid Uplander Ford Freestar A1
Engine Size CIDVLIT Hr o Bid o Bid 39 240 738i3.8 194
Add for Driver Air Bag o Bid Mo Bid Std Inciu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Mo Bid Mo Bid Std Inciu
Add for Full Size Spare Tire o Bid Mo Bid IA A
Size of Alternator o Bid Mo Bid 125 AMP 140 Armps
Add for Cruise Mo Bid Mo Bid §215.00 200.00
Delivery (Calendar Days ARC) o Bid Mo Bid EO-90 E0-50
Unit Price, F.O.B. Destination No Bid Ho Bid $14,890.00 15,704.00
STANDARD CNG
1= |8 Passenger, LWB, Min §2 L
7,700 L. GYW
Marne and Model Nurnber Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Engine Size CID/LT Hp Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Driver Air Bag Mo Bigt Mo Bid Mo Bid 1o Bicf
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Full Size Spare Tire o Bid o Bid Mo Bid o Bid
Size of Alternator o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Cruise Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARQ) Mo Bid o Bid 1o Bid o Bid
Unit Price, F.O.B. Destination No Bid Mo Bid [No Bid No Bid
STANDARD CERTIFIED LEV
12 Passenger, LWE, £ Cyl, Min 5.4 L
[ [Mame and Model Number [E3 = GMC TG 23406 Express CG23408 Ford E350 £l
Engine Size clo/T Hr 5.4 285 4.8 285 4.8 265 330054 255
(Add for Driver Air Bag Inclu. MIC Std Inclu.
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inclu. 1 MCL Std Inclu.
Add for Full Size Spare Tire Inciu $210.00 Std Inclu
Size of Alternator [115 AMP 145 A 145 AMP| 135Amps
Add far Cruise $200.00 $516.00 §145.00 240.00]
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) l0-50 90-120 60-90 E0-50
Unit Price, F.O.B. Destination $18,526.00 $19,067.00 $18,999.00 19,787.00)|
STANDARD CRG
w |12 T O Min B4L
Narme and Model Number Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Engine Size CIDAIT Hi Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
[Add for Driver Air Bag o Bid Mo Bid No Bid o Bidl
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
(Add for Full Size Spare Tire Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Size of Alternator o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Cruise Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO, Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Unit Price, F.0.B. Destinatior INo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
STANDARD, CNG
1t |15 F £ Gyl Min. 54 L
Marne and Model Nurnber Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid
Engine Size clo/uT Hr o Bidl Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bidl
[Add for Driver Air Bag o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid
(Add for Full Size Spare Tire Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Size of Allernator o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Cruise o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid




BID TAB

BID NUMBER: 8SITHVEHICLESSTK-NH Carl Blaok Antsmative Bill Heard Chevrolet Logany Ferd | PFROE ¥7
I_ DESCRIPTION RESPONRE TOTAL RESFONSE TOTRL REEFONSE TOTAL RESFONSE TOTAL
LEV
1 |15 Fuvsenger, LWE, § Cyl Min. 34 L
Marme and Model Number E350 531 GMC TG 33706 Express CG33708 Ford E350 531
Engine Size clo/uT Hr 5.4 255 6.0 300 6.0 300 33005.4 255
(Add for Driver Air Bag Inciu. MIC Std Inclu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inciu 1 MNCL Std Inciu.
(Add for Full Size Spare Tire Inciu §210.00 St Inclu.
Size of Alternator 115 AMP 1454 145AMP 135 Amps
Add far Cruise $200.00 $516.00 §145.00 240.00
Delivery (Calendar Days ARC) 6i0-80 90-120 60-90 60-00
UInit Price, F.0.B. Destination $19,338.00 $21,819.00 $21,149.00 20,364.00
STANDARD CERTIFIED LEV
e [15P nger; LWE, & Cyl Min 6.0L
Disssl Engine
Marne and Model Nurnber o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Engine Size clo/uT He Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bidt
[Add for Driver Air Bag o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
(Add for Anti-Lock Brakes o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
(Add for Full Size Spare Tire i Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Size of Alternator Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Cruise o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARC] Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid 1o Bid
Unit Price, F.0.B. Destination INo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
«4 (VANS, CARGO - 2007 MODELS
MINIVAN CERTIFIED LEV
[ e [1700 Lb. Fayload, § Cyi, RWD
Marne and Model Number 1o Bid o Bid Uplander Ford Freestar AB4
Engine Size CID/LT Hi Mo Bid Mo Bid 3.9 240 256i4.2 201
[Add for Driver Air Bag o Bid Mo Bid Std Inclu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes o Bid Mo Bid Std Inciy.
Add for Full Size Spare Tire o Bid Mo Bid A e
Size of Allernator Mo Bid Mo Bid 125 AMP 140 Amps
Add far Cruise o Bid Mo Bid 200.00
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) o Bid Mo Bid 60-90 60-30
Uinit Price, F.0.B. Destination INo Bid No Bid $15,599.00 12,431.00
STANDARD CERTIFIED LEV
2000 L. Payload, SWE, 8 Cyl, KWS
[ [Mame and Model Number E150 E14 GMC 13405 TG CGZIIE E150 E14
Engine Size CID/IT Hi 4.6 225 43 195 48 285 281/4 8 225
(Add for Driver Air Bag iy MIC St Inchu,
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inciu 1 NCL Std Inciu.
Add for Full Size Spare Tire Inciu $110.00 Std Inciu.
Size of Alternator 115 AMF 1454 105 AMP 115Amps
Add for Cruise $200.00 $416.00 Include Tit §350.0 240.00
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO, 50-30 90-120 60-90 B0-80
Unit Price, F.0 B. Destination $13,929.00| $16,412.00 $16,089.00 13,984.00
STANDARD CERTIFIED LEV
1988 Lb. Paylend, LWS, 5 Cyl, Min R4L, 4,500 I SVIVR
L]
MNarne and Model Number E250 524 Mo Bid CG23405 E150 E14
Engine Size CIDAIT Hi 5.4 255 Mo Bid 4.8 285 330/5.4 255
Add for Driver Air Bag Inci Mo Bid Std Inclu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inciu Mo Bid Std Inciu
(Add for Full Size Spare Tire Inciu Mo Bid Std Inciu.
Size of Alternator 115 AMF Mo Bid 105 AMP 135 Amps
Add for Cruise $200.00] Mo Bid Include Tit $350.01 240.00
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO, 50-30 Mo Bid 60-90 B0-50
Unit Price, F.0.8. Destination $16,193.00 No Bid $16,089.00 14,816.00
STANDARD, CNG
T | L
7,208 Lb. SV Win
Farme and Wode] armber Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid
Engine Size CID/LIT Hp o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid
[Add for Driver Air Bag o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes o Bid Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid
ddfor Full'Size Spare Tire Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Size of Alternator Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
dd for Cruise § o Bid Mo Bidl Mo Bid o Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO, o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid
Unit Price, F.0.B. Destination INo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




BID NUMRER: SEITRVEHICLESS7K-NH ool Mok Antamative Bill Heard Chevrolet Lagney Fand PRQE #8
DESCRIPTION RESPONSE I TOTAL RESFONIE I TOTAL RESPONSE TOTAL RESFONSE TOTAL
STANDARD CERTIFIED LEV | |
ma |3,008 L. Payissd, LW, 8 Cyi, bl £4 L
2,600 L. GYVIR Min. |
Warme and Model amber EZ50 [T] [GMC TG 23705 CGI3408 |ET50 [SE]
[ [Engine Size CID/LIT Hi 5.4 255 48 285 4.8 285 330i5.4 255
[ [Addfor Driver Air Bag Inclu NG Std Incly
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inciu. 1 MCL Std Inciu
(Add for Full Size Spare Tire Inciu §292.00 St Inclu.
Size of Alternator 115 AMP 105 A 105 AMP| 135 Armps
Add for Cruise $ §200.00 $416.00 Include Tit §250.0 240.00
| |Delivery (Calendar Days AROY 60-90 190-120 |60-50
Unit Price, F.0.8. Destinatior $15,223.00 $18,997.00 $16,089.00| 14,816.00
STANDARD CERTIFIED LEV
e (4180 Lb. Payload, LWS, § 3L M. R4 L
5,508 L. SV Min.
Marne and Model [urmber CGIH0g E 350 E3
Engine Size CIDAIT Hr K 55 4 285 30/5.4 255
T Ot er Air Ba il Eil ol
r Anti-Lock Brakes i St i
T Full Size Spare T I St i
T f_Alternator 15 AME [105 AMF 35 AMPS
OF Cruise § §Z00.00] Tnclude Tift §350.00] 240.00
Delivery (Calendar Days AHO, B0-00 50-00 hm
Oni Price, F.0.5. De stinatior $16,790.00| Mo Bid 18,319.00 16,753.00
STANDARD, CNG
my |4168 L. Payisad, LW, 8 CyL Min E4 L
5,500 Lb. SV Mim.
[ [Wame and Model Murmber Mo Bid Ho Bid No Bid o Bid
Engine Size CID/LIT Hi Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Driver Air Bag o Bid Mo Bid o Bid hio Bid
[Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Full Size Spare Tire o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid
178 O ANernamn Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
odfor Cruise ¥ o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid
Unit Price, F.O.B. Destination INo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid
¢ | SMALL/MID-8I1ZE UTILITY
VE - DELS
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
o |2, 3Beer; Min. 100 Vil
[y 448 Lita
Marme and Model Mumber Ford Escape UO3 Mo Bid Equinox 1LF 26 Ford Escape uoz
Engine Size clo/uT Hp 30 200 Mo Bid 34 185 30 200
Add for Driver Air Bag Inciu Mo Bid Std Inclu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inch, o Bid Std Inclu.
Add for Rear Win Defogger Inci o Bid St Inclu
Add for HD Alternator iR Mo Bid Std e
Add for Towing Package $333.00 Mo Bid $350 395.00
Add for Cruise Inclu, Mo Bid Std Inciu
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) £0-90 Mo Bid 60-90 G0-50
Unit Price, F.O.B. Destination $17,639.00| No Bid $18,550 18,690.00
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
=™ |, 2-Bser, Min 100 Vil
8=Cyll 48 LN
Name and Model Number Ford escape U93 Mo Bid Equinox 1LG26 Ford Escape 193
Engine Size CIDAIT Hp 3.0 200 1o Bid 3.4 185 2.0 200
Add for Driver Air Bag Inci Mo Bid St Incly
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inch. Mo Bid Std Inciu
[Add for Rear Win Defogger inciu Mo Bid Std Inciy.
Add for HD Alternator iR Mo Bid Std RE
[Add for Towing Package $238.00 Mo Bid $350 395.00
Add for Cruise Inch, Mo Bid Std Inciu
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) 60-80 Mo Bid 0-90 E0-80
Unit Price, F.0.B. Destination $19,181.00 No Bid $19,958 20,229.00
SFECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
(e |29, ABaer, M o7V
] SALNE.
Name and Model Number Explorer UG3 GMC TS 15506 Trailblazer C515506 Ford Explorer UB3
Engine Size CIDAIT Hp 4.0 210 4.2 20 42 291 24514.0 210
[Add for Driver Air Bag Inch. (i3 Std Inciu
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inch. MG Std Inciu
[Add for Rear Win Defogger Inciu $210.00 $175.00 Inciu
Add fnr HD AHRormator TR PR B P TS




BID NUMBER: OSITRVEHICLESSTK-NH Allan Vigil Ford il Binok Rntsmetive Bill Heard Chevrolet Legany Fand FROE #3
DESCRIPTION RESPONSE TOTAL RESFONSE TOTAL RESPONSE TOTAL RESFONSE TOTAL
[ [20, 4-Beer, Min 107" Vi
B-Cylmder, 4.6 L M.
Name and Model Number Explorer UG3 Mo Bid T railblazer C515508 Ford Explarer UG3
Engine Size CIDAIT Hp 4.6 292 Mo Bid 5.3 302 285i4.8 282
Add for Driver Air Bag Inciu Mo Bid Std Inciu.
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inciu. Mo Bid Std Inclu
Add for Rear Win Defogyger Inclu Mo Bid §175.00 Inclu.
Add for HD Alternator A Mo Bid Std MEA
Add for Towing Package §182.00 Mo Bid St 275.00
Add for Cruise Inciu. Mo Bid Std Inclu.
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) £0-80 Mo Bid 0-90 G0-50
Unit Price, F.0.B. Destination $19,194.00 No Bid $19,800.00 19,154.00
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
B |ANS, 4-Beer; Min 107 Vil
E-Cylmdar, 4.0 L M.
Name and Model Number Ford escape US8 GMC TT 15506 Mo Bid Mo Bid
Engine Size cipam Hp 2.3 15! 4.2 FE Mo Bid Mo Bid
[Add for Driver Air Bag Inch. (i3 Mo Bid o Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inch. (i3 Mo Bid o Bid
[Add for Rear Win Defogger Inciu $210.00 Mo Bid o Bid
Add for HD Alernator A 150 A Std Mo Bid o Bid
Add for Towing Package RIS $248.00 Mo Bid Mo Bid
Deduct for Ho Cruise Inchu. $125.00 Mo Bid o Bidt
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) 50-120 40-120 Mo Bid o Bid
Unit Price, F.0.B. Destination $26,460.00| $22,445.00 No Bid Mo Bid
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
[ar [@HE, 4-Bver, Min. 107 Ve
-Cylmder, 4.5 L M.
Hame and Model Humber Explorer U73 Mo Bid Trailblazer CT15506 Ford Explorer 73
Engine Size CIDLTT Hi 4.0 210 Io Bid 4.2 291 24514.0 210
Add for Driver Air Bag Inci Mo Bid St Inchy
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inchu. Mo Bid St Inclu
Add for Rear Win Defogger Tnci REEL] 175.00| Inci
Add for HD Alternator i, Mo Bid Std A
Add for Towing Package §182.00 o Bid Std 275.00
Add for Cruise Inci. Mo Bid Std Inciu
[ [Delivery (Calendar Days ARD) B0-50 o Bid 6000 6050
[~ [Unit Price, F.0.B. Destination $19,000.00 MNo Bid 20,820.00 20,163.00|
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
[ e |40, 4-Bser, Min. 107" W
-Gyl 44 LuHk.
Name and Model Number Explorer U73 Mo Bid Trailblazer CT Ford Explorer urs
Engine Size CIDALIT Hy. 46 292 Mo Bid 5.3 302 261/4.6 292
Add for Driver Air Bag Inciu Mo Bid Std | nclu
[Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inciu Mo Bid Std Inciu
[Add for Rear Win Defogger Inch. Mo Bid 175.00] Inclu.
Add for HD ARernator A, Mo Bidl Std WA
Add for Towing Package §182.00 Mo Bid Std 275.00
Deduct for No Cruise Inciu Mo Bid Std Inclu
Delivery (Calendar D ays ARO) £0-90 Mo Bid 60-90 E0-50
Onit Price, F.0.B. Destination $21,127.00 No Bid 21,855.00 21,231.00]
&7 [FULL-8IZE UTILITY VEHICLES
2007 MODELS
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
[+ [2W0, 4-Beer; Min. 116"
B Eyly & 504 Lh, VAR Min,, 5.3 L Mis.
Name and Model Humber Expedition U15 GMC TC 10706 Tahoe CC10706 Ford Expedition 1119
Engine Size CIDLTT A 5.4 300 5.3 320 53 320 330/5.4 00
Add for Driver Air Bay Inciu N/ Std Inlcu.
[Add for Anti-Lock Brakes Inciu MNIC Std Inicu
Add for Rear Defogger Inciu. NIC Std Inlcu
[Add for HD Alternator Inch. A Std A
Add for Towing Package 5298.00 $355.00 5td 350,07
Add for Cruise Inchy $125.00 Std Inicu
Delivery (Calen dar Days ARQ) 50-80 90-120 60-90 60-80
[nit Price, F.0.B. Destination $24,506.00| $26,867.00 $26,599.00 22,960.00|
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
[+a [0, 2-Hser; Min. 116" e
B Eyl, & 504 Lh, $VWR Min,, .3 L Mis.
ame ani odel Number Expedition U16 GMC TK 10706 Tahoe CK10706 Ford Expedition &)
ngine Size CIDLTT A 5.4 300 53 320 53 32 330/5.4 300 |
1244 far Drivier Air Ban IR T PipTE v ey T




BIB NUMBER: 0SITBYEHICLESBTK-NH Caal Blnok Antometive Bill Heard Chevrolet | Lagasy Ford PAGE 310
DESCRIPTION RESPONSE TOTAL REEPFONSE TSTAL RESPONSE TOTAL RESPONSE TOTAL
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
[44e [ZW0, 4Boer, Min. 136~ e
B Gyl 4,404 Lh, 4VWR Min, §.0 L Mis.
[ [Wame and Model Number Mo Bid GMC TC 20906 Suburban CC20306 Ford Expedtion___El K1
Engine Size CIDLTT A o Bid 6.0 352 6.0 352 330054 300
Add for Driver Air Bay Mo Bid N/ Std Inciu
[Add for Anti-Lock Brakes o Bid /G Std Inciu
Add for Rear Defogger Mo Bid NIC Std Inclu
[Add for HD AHlternator o Bid A Std A
Add for Towing Package o Bid $385.00 Std 360.00
Add for Cruise Mo Bid $125.00 std Inciu.
Delivery (Calendar Days ARO) Mo Bid 90-120 60-90 50-90
Unit Price, F.0.B. Destination No Bid $31,158.00 29,488.00 26,638.00|
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
W _|NS, 4-Beer;, Min. 1M Mieeivare
| [19 Cyi, 1,668 Lb. OVWR MIn, 4.3 L M.
[ [Fame and Model Number Mo Bid o Bid Suburban CK20806 Mo Bid
Engine Size CIDALTT Hf o Bid Mo Bid 6.0 352 o Bid
Add for Driver Alr Bag Mo Bid o Bid Gitdl o Bid
Add for Anii-Lock Brakes Mo Bid o Bid Gt Mo Bid
Add for Rear Defogger Mo Bid Mo Bid Std Mo Bid
[Add for HD Alternator o Bid Mo Bid Std o Bid
[Add for Towing Package Mo Bid Mo Bid Std o Bid
Add for Cruise Mo Bid o Bid Stol Mo Bidl
elivery (Calendar Days ARO) o Bid o Bid 50-30 o Bid
Unit Price, F.0.B. Destination Mo Bid Mo Bid 31,799.00 [No Bid
SPECIALTY CERTIFIED LEV
[ e |20, 4-Boer, Min. 136~ Vi
B Cyl, 3,804 Lb. OVWR Min, 7.3 L Min. Disasl
[ [Wame and Model Rumber Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Hid
Fngine Size CIDALT HE Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Driver Air Bag Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid o Bid
Add for Anti-Lock Brakes o Bid Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid
Add for Rear Defogger Mo Bid Na Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for HD ARernator o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid o Bid
Add for Towing Package Mo Bid Mo end Mo Bid Mo Bid
Add for Cruise o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Delivery (Calendar Days ARD) Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid
Unit Price, F.0.B. Destination No Bid Mo Bid [NoBid No Bid
a3 [TOWING HITCHES
CLASS Factory Hitches Class Il Class EEEA] 215.00
Class V Class Il Class IV 395.00
ClassV 395.00
DESIGH LTHITS GO0VGO00 Pick Ups& Vans
1200/12000 Pick Ups 500-10,000 Ibs
APPROPIIATE FOR FOLLOWING VEHICLES Rangers,F 150, vVans, Wiagons,
Pickups, All Full Bized Vans, F250,F 350
and Uplander Passenger &
Cargo Wans
ADDTTTONAL COST $209.00
TOMOO T200.00| F505.00(
«3 (OTHER OFTIONS |
TOOL BOX
Ma cturer United Welding United Welding United VWelding $399.00 |United Welder |
[ [Model# Tsa 72 TBS 69 [ 7B
THS-69
Unit Price $285.00 $349.00 $399.00 $399.00 $355.00
UTILITY BODY
Manufacturer Stahl Marious Maonroe Manroe
Model # 9RVVE-485 G5 1080 MCH 108 IM
Unit Price $4,375.00Varies wTruck $4,500-$8, 700 $6,399.00 $5,790.00
AMBER LIGHT BAR
Manufacturer Star 48" Amber Whelen W helan Whelen
Model # 9400H (48" [V HE-G WA 20i48"
Unit Price $100.00 $375.00 $299.00 $674.00
$799.00
ATTACH LITERATURE ON EACH OFTION [No Bid 4 Carner Strobes






