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Fulton County Public Bid Opening

Bid: RFQ 68CT61417YA

Close date/Time: 2008-05-07  14:00:00

Default Commeadity Group 39546

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

Page:

V80000004489 Park Sced Company

Default Commedity Group 39540

V80000004489 Park Sced Company

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$8.00

$17.68

. Default Commedity Group 59540

V80000004489 Park Seed Company

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$12.50

. Default Commodity Group 59540

VS0060004489 Park Seed Company

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

NO BID

. Default Commodity Group 59540

VS0000004489 Park Seed Company

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

NG BiD

. Default Commodity Group 59540

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

V30000004489 Fark Seed Company

. Default Commaedity Group 59540

VSO000004489 Park Seed Company

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

513.50

$16.50

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pols

Default Commodity Group 9540
VS(0BU004489 Park Seed Company
Default Commodity Group 39540

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$1.25

VSO0600034489 Park Seed Compuany

$50.50
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening

Bid: RFQ 08CT61417VA

Close date/Time: 2088-05-07 14:00:00

16. Default Commedity Group 39540

i1

VS0060004489 Park Seed Company

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

Page:

h

. Default Commodity Group 9540

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$91.50

VS0060004489 Park Seed Company

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

NO BID

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$70.50

$113.95

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$74.95

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$15.60

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

880,758

12, Default Commodity Group 59540
V80600004489 Park Seed Company
13. Defanlt Commodity Group 59540
V86000004489 Park Seed Company
14. Default Commodity Group 59540
VYS0000004489 Park Seed Company
15. Default Commeodity Groap 59540
VS0080004489 Park Seed Company
16. Default Commadity Group 59540
VSOG60004489 Park Seed Company
17 Default Commeodity Group 39540
VS0800004489 Park Seed Company
I8, Defagit Commodity Group 59540
Y50000004489 Park Seed Company
19. Default Commedity Group 59540

V50000004489 Park Seed Company

Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

[

$25.00

NG BID
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. Default Commedity Group

. Default Commodity Group

. Default Commeodity Group

. Default Commodity Group
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Fulton County Public Bid Opening

Bid: RFQ 08CT61417YA

Close date/Time: 2008-05-07  14:00:00

Defauit Commodity Group 39340 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

Page:

$62.75

VSa000004482 Park Seed Company

Defanit Commodity Group 59340 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

VS00060004489 Park Seed Company

NO BID

Befault Commodity Group 49540 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

V80000004489 Park Seed Company

NO BID

59540  Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$85.00

V50000004489 Park Seed Company

59340 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

NO BID

VS0000084489 Park Seed Company

59540 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

VS§0000004489 Park Seed Company

NO BID

Default Commodity Group 59340 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

V50000004489 Park Seed Company

$20.00

59540 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

V350000004489 Park Seed Company

NO BID

Default Commodity Group 59540 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

VEG000004489 Park Seed Company

NGO BID

39346  Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

Defanlt Commeodity Group

VS00G0664489 Park Seed Company

Default Commodity Group 29540 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

NG BID

$50.60

VS0000004489 Park Seed Company
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FULTON COUNTY
Fuiton County Public Bid Opening
Bid: RFQ 08CTsl417YA
Close date/Time: 2008-05-07 14:00:00
befault Commodity Group 59540 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supphies, Labels, Planters Pots

Page:

$50.08

VR(000004489 Park Seed Company

Default Commodity Group 59540  Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

£0.00

VSa000004489 Park Seed Company

Default Commeodity Group 59548 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$56.060

VSG060004489 Park Seed Company

Default Commodity Group 59540 Nursery, Greenhouse & Floral Supplies, Labels, Planters Pots

$0.00

VS0000004489 Park Seed Company




